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MEDIA RELEASE  

 

Croesus Retail Trust voted ‘Best Small-cap Company  
in Singapore’ in FinanceAsia survey 

 

Singapore, 15 May 2014 – Croesus Retail Trust (“CRT”) was voted Singapore’s ‘Best Small-
cap Company’ in a 2014 annual survey by FinanceAsia, a monthly Hong Kong-based 
publication focused on news and developments in the Asian financial and capital markets.  

FinanceAsia’s Best Managed Companies Poll is an annual survey that identifies Asia’s best 
companies in the region, and was based on responses from 247 investors and analysts who 
specialise in Asia.  

Mr. Jim Chang, Chief Executive Officer and Executive Director of Croesus Retail Asset 
Management Pte. Ltd., said, “Topping the poll for the best small-cap category in Singapore 
signifies the confidence, interests and the investment theme from investors and analysts who 
know Asia and our business.  At CRT, we maintain a prudent approach on managing costs 
without sacrificing quality services to our tenants.  We are extremely pleased with this 
recognition, and we will continue to seek strategic opportunities to increase our investment 
exposure that reflect the growing strength of the Japanese economy and its commercial 
property sector.” 

Croesus Retail Asset Management Pte. Ltd., the trustee-manager of CRT had announced its 
3Q FY2014 results on 15 May 2014. On 6 March 2014, Croesus Retail Asset Management 
Pte. Ltd. acquired two strategically-located retail properties within Tokyo – Luz Omori and NIS 
Wave I.  The acquisitions represented a strategic move that was yield-accretive to CRT – 
growing its portfolio value by approximately 28.3% to JPY 67,830 million. 

Mr. Jeremy Yong, Co-Founder and Group Managing Director of Croesus Merchants 
International Pte. Ltd. (Sponsor of CRT) and Non-Executive Director of Croesus Retail Asset 
Management Pte. Ltd. said, “We are delighted to receive this recognition as CRT marks its 
first anniversary of its listing.  We will do our best to continuously deliver good results every 
quarter, and grow CRT from strength to strength.” 

The FinanceAsia Best Managed Companies Poll 2014, now into its 14th year, was 
conducted from 10 February to 14 March 2014 across 10 countries – China, Hong Kong, 
India, Indonesia, Malaysia, Philippines, Singapore, South Korea, Taiwan and Thailand.  The 
criteria for the small-cap category is a market capitalisation of USD 500 million and below. 
Respondents were asked to nominate their top three choices – three points were given to the 
first nomination; two points to the second nomination and one point to the third, with double 
weighting applied to the buy-side. 

– ENDS – 
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Investor contact: 

Ms. Hanako Tokunaga 

Tel: +65 6622 5531 

Email: htokunaga@croesusgroup.com  

Media contact: 

Ms. Deborah Yeo 

Tel: +65 6825 8083 / +65 9661 8390 

Email: dyeo@webershandwick.com  

 

About Croesus Retail Trust 

Croesus Retail Trust (“CRT”) is the first SGX-listed Asia-Pacific retail business trust with a 
portfolio located in Japan.  CRT is principally focused on investing in a diversified portfolio of 
predominantly retail real estate assets located in the Asia Pacific region.  CRT currently has 
six retail properties in Japan – Mallage Shobu, Aeon Town Moriya, Aeon Town Suzuka, Luz 
Shinsaibashi, Luz Omori and NIS Wave I – out of which four are located in the Greater Tokyo 
area.  CRT’s portfolio of assets in Japan allows it to create a core portfolio of stable income 
generating assets that serves as a foundation for CRT to pursue development and acquisition 
opportunities in the Asia-Pacific region, including Japan, to generate long-term capital value 
and long-term returns. 

CRT was awarded by FinanceAsia as ‘Best Small-cap Company in Singapore’ in its Best 
Managed Companies Poll for 2014.  CRT is part of the FTSE ST Small Cap Index and the 
TR/GPR/APREA Composite Index.  For more information on CRT, please visit 
www.croesusretailtrust.com.  

 

Important Notice 

This press release is not an offer of securities for sale or a solicitation of an offer to purchase 
securities. This release may contain forward-looking statements that involve risks and 
uncertainties. Forward-looking statements include statements regarding the intent, belief and 
current expectations of CRT or its officers with respect to various matters. When used in this 
press release, the words "expects," "believes," "anticipates," "plans," "may," "will," "should" 
and similar expressions, and the negatives thereof, are intended to identify forward-looking 
statements. Actual future performance, outcomes and results may differ materially from those 
expressed in forward-looking statements as a result of a number of risks, uncertainties and 
assumptions. Representative examples of these factors include (without limitation) general 
industry and economic conditions, interest rate trends, cost of capital and capital availability, 
availability of real estate properties, competition from other companies and venues for the 
sale/distribution of goods and services, shifts in customer demands, customers and partners, 
changes in operating expenses, including employee wages, benefits and training, 
governmental and public policy changes, and the continued availability of financing in the 
amounts and the terms necessary to support future business. You are cautioned not to place 
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undue reliance on these forward-looking statements, which are based on the current view of 
management on future events and speak only as of the date of this press release. CRT does 
not undertake to revise forward-looking statements to reflect future events or circumstances. 
No assurance can be given that future events will occur, that projections will be achieved, or 
that CRT’s assumptions are correct. The past performance of CRT is not indicative of the 
future performance of CRT.  Similarly, the past performance of the Trustee-Manager is not 
indicative of the future performance of the Trustee-Manager. 


