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SGX welcomes Haitong International to securities 
and derivatives markets as Trading Member 
 
 
Singapore Exchange (SGX) welcomes Haitong International Securities (Singapore) Pte Ltd as a 
Trading Member of both its securities and derivatives markets. 
 
Haitong International’s parent company, Haitong Securities, is a leading securities company in 
China, and one of its largest brokers. The admission of Haitong International to SGX brings the 
total number of Trading Members in SGX’s securities and derivatives markets to 26 and 45 
respectively.  
 
Chew Sutat, Head of Sales and Clients at SGX said, “At a time when China is rapidly developing 
its financial markets and economy, we are pleased to have firms like Haitong join our markets as a 
Member. The presence of Chinese members, with their network of clients in the mainland and 
elsewhere, will further enable Singapore to grow as a leading offshore centre for RMB.” 
 
“We are delighted to become a Trading Member of SGX’s securities and derivatives markets. As 
we continue to expand overseas, it is important that we establish our footprint in major international 
financial hubs. Haitong International is therefore proud to be one of the pioneering non-bank 
Chinese financial institutions in Singapore. Our specialisation in RMB products, and our 
established network in China, enable us to serve as a link between Chinese investors and 
Singapore’s capital markets. We can also connect Southeast Asian investors to opportunities in 
China,” said Dr Lin Yong, Deputy Chairman and Chief Executive Officer of Haitong International 
Securities Group Limited. 
 
Singapore’s securities market and derivatives markets have 26 and 27 Clearing Members each. In 
addition, there are 12 Clearing Members for OTC-traded financial derivatives on SGX AsiaClear. 
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About Singapore Exchange (SGX) 
 
Singapore Exchange (SGX) is the Asian Gateway, connecting investors in search of Asian growth 
to corporate issuers in search of global capital. SGX represents the premier access point for 
managing Asian capital and investment exposure, and is Asia’s most international exchange with 
more than 40% of companies listed on SGX originating outside of Singapore. SGX offers its clients 
the world’s biggest offshore market for Asian equity index futures, centred on Asia’s three largest 
economies – China, India and Japan.
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In addition to offering a fully integrated value chain from trading and clearing, to settlement and 
depository services, SGX is also Asia’s pioneering central clearing house. Headquartered in Asia’s 
most globalised city, and centred within the AAA strength and stability of Singapore’s island nation, 
SGX is a peerless Asian counterparty for the clearing of financial and commodity products. 
 
For more information, please visit www.sgx.com 
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