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ST Engineering’s Corporate Venture Capital Unit Invests In Cyber Security 
Business 

 

Singapore, 19 September 2017 – Singapore Technologies Engineering Ltd                          

(ST Engineering) today announced that its Corporate Venture Capital unit,                                

ST Engineering Ventures Pte Ltd (ST Engineering Ventures) has made a Series B 

investment of US$5.8m (about S$7.8m) for a minority interest in Janus Technologies, Inc., 

an endpoint cyber security provider based in California, US.   

“This is the first investment by our Corporate Venture Capital unit in companies with 

cutting edge technologies or breakthrough innovations,” said Vincent Chong, President & 

CEO of ST Engineering. “Our investment into Janus Technologies will benefit not just the 

Group’s Cyber Security business, but will also enable Janus Technologies’ organic growth 

as it will have access to our established business networks and channels.” 

The Group has identified cyber security, along with robotics, autonomous technology, and 

data analytics as strategic capabilities that it will invest in to create long term value and 

growth.  Through this investment, the Group’s electronics arm, ST Electronics will be able 

to provide a unique hardware-based cyber security solution that delivers a customised 

and secure platform and network security capabilities to its customers.    

“We are very pleased to have received this investment from ST Engineering, a leading 

technology and engineering group. We look forward to partnering ST Electronics to 

integrate the Janus Secure Computing Platform into their outstanding cyber security 

portfolio and accelerating the success and adoption of these products in the market,” said 

Sofin Raskin, Chairman and CEO of Janus Technologies. 
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This investment, shortly after ST Engineering Ventures was set up in July 2017 signals     

ST Engineering’s keen focus in moving beyond traditional R&D approaches to seek new 

technologies and ideas outside the Group to complement its internal capabilities in the 

Aerospace, Electronics, Land Systems and Marine sectors. Technology start-ups, like 

Janus Technologies scouted by ST Engineering Ventures will be able to integrate into the 

Group’s ecosystems and leverage its established business networks and channels for 

broader business capabilities to compete globally. They will also be able to tap on the 

Group’s technological expertise. 

 

The transaction is not expected to have any material impact on the consolidated net 

tangible assets (NTA) per share and earnings per share of ST Engineering for the current 

financial year.   

***** 
 

ST Electronics (Singapore Technologies Electronics Limited), is the electronics arm of 
Singapore Technologies Engineering Ltd, one of the largest public-listed companies on 
the Singapore Exchange. ST Electronics is a global engineering company specialising in 
the design, development and integration of advanced electronics and communications 
systems. Our capabilities are in Rail & Intelligent Transportation; Satellite & Broadband 
Communications; Info Comm Technologies; Command & Control operations, Training & 
Simulation; Intelligent Building & Security Systems and Cybersecurity. We have a 
presence in over 20 countries spanning North America, Latin America, Europe, Africa, the 
Middle East, China, India and Southeast Asia. For more information, please visit 
www.stee.stengg.com. 
 
ST Engineering (Singapore Technologies Engineering Ltd) is an integrated defence and 
engineering group specialising in the aerospace, electronics, land systems and marine 
sectors. It has global presence with offices in Asia, the Americas, Europe and the Middle 
East and employs about 22,000 employees. Across the globe, its employees bring 
innovation and technology together to create smart engineering solutions for its customers 
in the defence, government and commercial segments. Headquartered in Singapore, the 
Group reported revenue of $6.68b in FY2016 and ranks among the largest companies 
listed on the Singapore Exchange. It is a component stock of the FTSE Straits Times 
Index, MSCI Singapore and the SGX Sustainability Leaders Index. Please visit 
www.stengg.com for more information. 
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